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As the fight for same-sex marriage rages across the United States and lesbian and gay couples rush to
marriage license counters, the goal of marriage is still fiercely questioned within the LGBT movement.
Rarely has an objective so central to a social movement’s political agenda been so controversial within the
movement itself. While antigay forces work to restrict marriage to one man and one woman, lesbian and gay
activists are passionately arguing about the desirability, viability, and social consequences of same-sex
marriage.

The Marrying Kind? is the first book to draw on empirical research to examine these debates and how they
are affecting marriage equality campaigns. The essays in this volume analyze the rhetoric, strategies, and
makeup of the LGBT social movement organizations pushing for same-sex marriage, and address the dire
predictions of some LGBT commentators that same-sex marriage will spell the end of queer identity and
community. Case studies from California, Connecticut, Massachusetts, New Jersey, Oklahoma, Vermont,
and Canada illuminate the complicated politics of same-sex marriage, making clear that the current
disagreements among LGBT activists over whether marriage is conforming or transformative are far too
simplistic. Instead, the impact of the marriage equality movement is complex and often contradictory, neither
fully assimilationist nor fully oppositional.

Contributors: Ellen Ann Andersen, U of Vermont; Mary C. Burke, U of Vermont; Adam Isaiah Green, U of
Toronto; Melanie Heath, McMaster U, Ontario; Kathleen E. Hull, U of Minnesota; Katrina Kimport, U of
California, San Francisco; Jeffrey Kosbie; Katie Oliviero, U of Colorado, Boulder; Kristine A. Olsen;
Timothy A. Ortyl; Arlene Stein, Rutgers U; Amy L. Stone, Trinity U; Nella Van Dyke, U of California,
Merced.
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From reader reviews:

Debbie Siegel:

Book is usually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important matter to bring us around the
world. Close to that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A e-book The Marrying Kind?: Debating
Same-Sex Marriage within the Lesbian and Gay Movement will make you to become smarter. You can feel
much more confidence if you can know about every little thing. But some of you think that open or reading a
new book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you looking for
best book or suited book with you?

Michael Taylor:

Beside this specific The Marrying Kind?: Debating Same-Sex Marriage within the Lesbian and Gay
Movement in your phone, it may give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or information. The
information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh through the oven so don't always be worry if you
feel like an previous people live in narrow small town. It is good thing to have The Marrying Kind?:
Debating Same-Sex Marriage within the Lesbian and Gay Movement because this book offers to you
personally readable information. Do you oftentimes have book but you seldom get what it's about. Oh come
on, that will not end up to happen if you have this with your hand. The Enjoyable agreement here cannot be
questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss this? Find this book along with
read it from now!

Herbert Mikula:

Book is one of source of know-how. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen want book to know the update information of year in order to year. As we know those
guides have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world.
Through the book The Marrying Kind?: Debating Same-Sex Marriage within the Lesbian and Gay
Movement we can consider more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people? For being creative person
must love to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't possibly be
doubt to change your life by this book The Marrying Kind?: Debating Same-Sex Marriage within the
Lesbian and Gay Movement. You can more inviting than now.

Jennifer Fountain:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
from a book. Book is composed or printed or descriptive from each source that will filled update of news.
Within this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media
social like newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can
add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just seeking



the The Marrying Kind?: Debating Same-Sex Marriage within the Lesbian and Gay Movement when you
needed it?
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