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Long considered to be prime examples of late 1940s “headlight” and “Good Girl” art comics, issues of●

Junior and Sunny have been quite difficult to find and very expensive to obtain. Until now! Created,
written, and illustrated by the legendary E.C. Comics artist/writer/editor Al Feldstein for the notorious
Victor Fox of Fox Feature Publications, The Complete Junior and Sunny presents the full run of these
comics. Along with a historical Introduction by Grant Geissman, the book also presents the one issue of
Meet Corliss Archer that Feldstein did for Fox. Although the stories are basically charming, “typical
teenage” period pieces, Feldstein’s artwork for them often pushes the envelope for the time, with titillating
covers depicting ample “headlights,” and often-suggestive images in the stories themselves. It’s probably a
good thing that Dr. Fredric Wertham never found out about Junior and Sunny! Seduction of the innocent,
indeed!
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From reader reviews:

Marlon Taylor:

The book Complete Junior and Sunny by Al Feldstein will bring you to definitely the new experience of
reading a book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. In the event you try to find new book
you just read, this book very appropriate to you. The book Complete Junior and Sunny by Al Feldstein is
much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can
quickly to read the book.

Louie Laforge:

The publication untitled Complete Junior and Sunny by Al Feldstein is the reserve that recommended to you
to study. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to anyone. The language that writer
use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of research when write
the book, and so the information that they share to your account is absolutely accurate. You also can get the
e-book of Complete Junior and Sunny by Al Feldstein from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Daniel Adams:

This Complete Junior and Sunny by Al Feldstein is great guide for you because the content that is full of
information for you who all always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This kind of
book reveal it information accurately using great plan word or we can say no rambling sentences within it.
So if you are read the idea hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight
forward sentences but tricky core information with beautiful delivering sentences. Having Complete Junior
and Sunny by Al Feldstein in your hand like having the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous just
one. We can say that no guide that offer you world inside ten or fifteen second right but this publication
already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt that?

Jamie Norman:

As a student exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library as well
as to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's heart or real
their pastime. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time there
but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring in addition to can't see
colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we
know that on this era, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. So , this Complete Junior and Sunny by Al Feldstein can make you sense more interested to read.
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