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Written by US Civil War veteran John Mead Gould and originally published in 1877, "How to Camp Out"
gives excellent insight into how people camped out over a century ago. It shows that people were quite
capable of enjoying the outdoors without the benefit of Coleman stoves and lanterns, the L.L. Bean Catalog,
an EMS store at the shopping mall or any modern conveniences. "How to Camp Out" helps us understand
that people adapted to their environment and could endure the rigors of the simple life because the rewards
were far greater. "How to Camp Out" contains practical camping advice which is still pertinent to this day,
more than 130 years after it was published. This ranges from "Don't waste your money buying every new
invention." to "Wear what you please if it be comfortable and durable: do not mind what people say. When
you are camping you have the right to be independent." Civil War re-enactors study this book for the author's
hard-won wisdom for on the march and in the encampment during that conflict. Accordingly, we've
recreated the original first edition cover art so it won't look TOO out of place in a re-enactor's dog tent.
Regardless of whether you are a novice camper, a Civil War re-enactor, a nostagia buff or a professional
historian you will find reading "How to Camp Out" a rich and rewarding experience. The interior of this new
edition from Ropesend Creek Press is a perfect replica of the original. Page numbering, illustrations, layout,
table of contents, index and any footnotes are exactly as they appeared when the original book was
published. With this new edition, the book is ready for a new lease of life through a modern readership.
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From reader reviews:

Jordan Weatherspoon:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to know everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or even goal; it means that
guide has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they take because their hobby is reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, person feel need book if they found difficult problem or even exercise. Well,
probably you will need this How To Camp Out.

Randell Easley:

What do you regarding book? It is not important along? Or just adding material if you want something to
explain what the one you have problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy particular person? If
you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have extra
time? What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. They must answer that question mainly
because just their can do this. It said that about publication. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is correct.
Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this How To Camp Out to read.

Jean Ashburn:

This book untitled How To Camp Out to be one of several books that best seller in this year, that's because
when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this kind of book
in the book retail outlet or you can order it via online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It
makes you quicker to read this book, as you can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no
reason to your account to past this publication from your list.

Sandra Alexander:

Reading a book to become new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to go through a book.
When you learn a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your
knowledge, since book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds
of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your study, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, and also
soon. The How To Camp Out will give you a new experience in looking at a book.
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