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Our engagement with time is a ubiquitous feature of our lives. We are aware of time on many scales, from
the briefest flicker of change to the way our lives unfold over many years. But to what extent does this
encounter reveal the true nature of temporal reality? To the extent that temporal reality is as it seems, how do
we come to be aware of it? And to the extent that temporal reality is not as it seems, why does it seem that
way? These are the central questions addressed by Simon Prosser in Experiencing Time.
These questions take on a particular importance in philosophy for two reasons. Firstly, there is a view
concerning the metaphysics of time, known as the B-theory of time, according to which the apparently
dynamic quality of change, the special status of the present, and even the passage of time are all illusions.
Instead, the world is a four-dimensional space-time block, lacking any of the apparent dynamic features of
time. If the B-theory is correct, as the book argues, then it must be explained why our experiences seem to
tell us otherwise. Secondly, experiences of temporal features such as changes, rates and durations are of
independent interest because of certain puzzles that they raise, the solutions to which may shed light on
broader issues in the philosophy of mind.
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From reader reviews:

Wilbert Westerfield:

Within other case, little persons like to read book Experiencing Time. You can choose the best book if you
like reading a book. Providing we know about how is important some sort of book Experiencing Time. You
can add information and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, because from
book you can know everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you will end up
known. About simple factor until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this era, we could open a
book or maybe searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel weary to go
to the library. Let's read.

Julia Sullivan:

Book is actually written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Close to that you can your reading talent was fluently. A guide Experiencing Time will make you to end up
being smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think
in which open or reading a book make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they can be thought like
that? Have you seeking best book or acceptable book with you?

Jason Norfleet:

Beside this particular Experiencing Time in your phone, it can give you a way to get nearer to the new
knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from the oven so don't
become worry if you feel like an older people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have Experiencing
Time because this book offers for your requirements readable information. Do you sometimes have book but
you don't get what it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this in
the hand. The Enjoyable agreement here cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island.
Techniques you still want to miss the item? Find this book as well as read it from right now!

Major Talley:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is prepared or printed or created from each source that will filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media
social similar to newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just searching
for the Experiencing Time when you required it?
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