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As incredible as it may be to believe, three years before the Sept. 11 bombing of the World Trade Center a
Chinese military manual titled Unrestricted Warfare touted such an attack – suggesting it would be difficult
for the U.S. military to cope with.

Here is an excerpt from Unrestricted Warfare:

"Whether it be the intrusions of hackers, a major explosion at the World Trade Center, or a bombing attack
by bin Laden, all of these greatly exceed the frequency bandwidths understood by the American military..."

Surprisingly, Osama bin Laden is mentioned frequently in this book.

Now NewsMax.com is making the CIA translation of this shocking book available to all Americans.

On Sept. 11, 2001, Americans and the world witnessed one of the most horrific acts ever to take place on
American soil.

Our media and government were quick to declare the acts of that day as simply terrorism by a nationless
group known as al-Qaeda.

In reading China’s military manual Unrestricted Warfare, you will learn that the events of Sept. 11 were not
a random act perpetrated by independent agents.

Instead, Chinese military planners believe that terrorism is just one of the many tools at the hands of nations
and their terrorist allies to wage total war against the United States.

You will be surprised to learn:

· The two PLA colonels who authored Unrestricted Warfare have been hailed as heroes in China since Sept.
11

· The Chinese state-run propaganda machine is cashing in on the terror attacks ... producing books, films and
video games glorifying the strikes as a humbling blow against an arrogant nation.

· Chinese Communist Party officials are saying that President Jiang Zemin has obsessively and gleefully
watched and re-watched pictures of the aircraft crashing into the World Trade Center.

· The CIA’s own translation agency reported that this book identifies the U.S. as China’s main enemy, and
details how a weak nation can destroy America using unorthodox attacks – like the 9-11 attacks.

· China is preparing itself and encouraging others to engage the U.S. in total war. The book is chock full of
plans and strategies, from using computers, to smuggling illegal immigrants, to manipulating the stock
markets, to influencing the U.S. media, to using weapons of mass destruction – all to destroy America.

Recent press reports indicate that China has assisted and continues to assist militarily and economically the



Taliban and al-Qaeda – even after Sept. 11.

The doctrine of total war outlined in Unrestricted Warfare clearly demonstrates that the People’s Republic of
China is preparing to confront the United States and our allies by conducting "asymmetrical" or
multidimensional attacks on almost every aspect of our social, economic and political life.

The media and Congress are keeping a lid on this book because of the implications of U.S.-China economic
and trade relations.

But now you can bypass them by getting a copy yourself!
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From reader reviews:

Richard Holeman:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add
your knowledge by the book entitled Unrestricted Warfare: China's Master Plan to Destroy America. Try to
make book Unrestricted Warfare: China's Master Plan to Destroy America as your friend. It means that it can
to be your friend when you truly feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it
is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you more confidence because you can know almost
everything by the book. So , let's make new experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Lily Winstead:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information currently can get by anyone in everywhere.
The information can be a expertise or any news even an issue. What people must be consider whenever those
information which is in the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking seriously which one is
suitable to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you find the unstable resource then you
understand it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities will
not happen with you if you take Unrestricted Warfare: China's Master Plan to Destroy America as the daily
resource information.

Billie Gould:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the free time or they will get large
amount of stress from both daily life and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity do
you have when the spare time coming to you of course your answer can unlimited right. Then ever try this
one, reading books. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the particular book you
have read is Unrestricted Warfare: China's Master Plan to Destroy America.

Carla Helton:

In this particular era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What you
have to do is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of
several books in the top checklist in your reading list is actually Unrestricted Warfare: China's Master Plan to
Destroy America. This book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in
getting precious person. By looking up and review this publication you can get many advantages.
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